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SCHOOL READINESS

School Readiness program provides parent
education and support to families with children ages
0-5 at no cost and with no income eligibility
requirements. The services offered include one-on-
one parent education using Parents as Teachers
home visitation curriculum, weekly playgroups,
referrals to various community resources, access to
dental and health care services and developmental
screenings. School Readiness home visitors want to
partner with you to help your child reach their fullest
potential!

HEALTHY FAMILIES TEHAMA

Healthy Families Tehama offers you a Personal
Support Coach to help you be the best parent(s) you
can be. Services include family-centered emotional
support, referrals to other services, assistance with
navigatin access to services in the community and
education and career goal setting. Services are
offered in your home or place of your choice. Your
Coach helps you gain the tools you need to have a
healthy baby, be the best parent you can be and
give your child a solid start in life. There are no
costs or income eligibility requirements for these
services. Healthy Families Tehama serves pregnancy
to age 3.

HEALTHY BEGINNINGS

Healthy Beginnings is a Public Health Nursing
program that provides education, referrals and case
management. This program is available to pregnant
women and families with young children. 
Public Health Nurses Provide: Growth and
Developmental Assessments and Education;
Coordination of services; Parent Education;
Coordination/Referral to community resources;
Safety instruction; Information on health topics and
nutrition; other services may be available based on
individual needs.

NOTHERN CALIFORNIA CHILD
DEVELOPMENT, INC. (NCCDI)

NCCDI offers programs such as Early Head Start
and Head Start that promote school readiness of
children ages birth to 5 from low-income families by
supporting their development in a comprehensive
way. They deliver services to children and families in
core areas of early learning, health, and family well-
being while engaging parents as partners every step
of the way. NCCDI offer Head Start preschool
programs, which primarily serve 3 and 4 year old
children, and Early Head Start programs designed
for infants, toddlers and pregnant women.

THE STATE PRESCHOOL PROGRAM

The State Preschool Program has 8 sites which offer
creative, hands-on learning for kids including math,
literacy, science, art and discovery centers. Free to 
 income-qualified families, with part-day and full-
day schedules available. Private pay spots available
with part-day and full-day schedules available. We
have experienced staff in a safe and nurturing
environment with nutritional meals served.

THERE IS NO WRONG DOOR TO RECEIVE RESOURCES

AND SERVICES


